2025 HOT MIX PAVEMENT TENDER RESULTS

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6.1 Item 6.2
Chesley - 2nd Paisley - Paisley - Tara - Tara Elderslie - |E5 - McAllister| Elderslie -
St. SE, Church St. | Balaklava St. | Arena north [Concession 10 Bridge Sideroad 15
Chesley Lawn | from BR3 to | from George | ball diamond | north of 15 from Con 2
Bowling Ross St. St. to James driveway Sdrd South Elderslie to
Contractor St. Elderslie BR11 SUBTOTAL HST TOTAL
Multiple Enterprises Inc. $ 9,686.25 | $ 19,987.50 | $ 16,143.75|$ 7,875.00 | $ 39,352.50 | No Bid No Bid $ 93,045.00 [ $ 12,095.85 [ $ 105,140.85
E.C. King Contracting $ 10,117.80 | $ 24,154.00 | $ 18,396.00 | $ 4,910.00 | $ 35,033.00 | $ 97,913.50 ($ 177,187.50| ¢ 367,711.80 | $ 47,802.53 | $ 415,514.33
Walker Aggregates $ 13,198.50 | $ 28,145.00 | $ 24,360.00 |$ 7,575.00 | $ 35,907.50 | $141,468.75 |($ 177,975.00 | $ 428,629.75 | $ 55,721.87 | $ 484,351.62
Vandriel Excavating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102,031.59 | No Bid $ 102,031.59 | $ 13,264.11 | $ 115,295.70
Cox Construction $ 18,545.94 | ¢ 25,238.20 | $ 22,894.20 | $ 10,606.00 | $ 37,439.20 | $158,268.83 ($ 168,399.00 | $ 441,391.37 | $ 57,380.88 | $ 498,772.25
MacDonnell Excavating $ 12,915.00 | $ 22,100.00 | $ 17,850.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 37,100.00 | $104,125.00 ($ 192,150.00| $ 389,990.00 [ $ 50,698.70 | $ 440,688.70
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